
CITY OF FLORENCE, SC 
STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT 

INVITATION TO BID NO. 2014-50 
BID TABULATION 

 
 

Wally’s Fire & Safety Equipment 
Plan 1          $99,921.60 
Plan 1 including Option 1      $101,541.63 
Plan 2         No bid 
Plan 2 including Option 1      No bid 
 
Dana Safety Supply 
Plan 1         $94,304.74 
Plan 1 including Option 1      No bid 
Plan 2         No bid 
Plan 2 including Option 1      No bid 
 
C. W. Williams & Company 
Plan 1         $100,310.40 
Plan 1 including Option 1      $100,828.80 
Plan 2         $106,631.48 
Plan 2 including Option 1      $107,183.64 
 
TS Rescue 
Plan 1         $102,828.50 
Plan 1 including Option 1      No bid 
Plan 2         No bid 
Plan 2 including Option 1      No bid 
 
AE & J Lighting, LLC dba: Tra-Fx Public Safety Supply 
Plan 1         $103,615.20 
Plan 1 including Option 1      No bid 
Plan 2         No bid 
Plan 2 including Option 1      No bid 
 
Safe Industries 
Plan 1         $106,596.00 
Plan 1 including Option 1      $107,568.00 
Plan 2         $111,280.40 
Plan 2 including Option 1      $112,597.88 
 
NAFECO 
Plan 1         $121,749.48 
Plan 1 including Option 1      $124,302.60 
Plan 2         $127,442.48 
Plan 2 including Option 1      $130,114.96 
 
 
 


